
Strategies To Support Struggling Adolescent
Readers Grades 12

Adolescence is a crucial period in a student's life, where they undergo significant
physical, emotional, and cognitive changes. For struggling adolescent readers in
grade 12, the challenges can be immense. However, with effective strategies and
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support, these struggling readers can overcome their difficulties and thrive
academically.
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1. Individualized Instruction

One of the key strategies to support struggling adolescent readers is to provide
individualized instruction tailored to their specific needs. Every student has
different strengths and weaknesses when it comes to reading. By assessing their
abilities and designing targeted lessons, educators can address their individual
challenges and help them make progress.

For instance, providing scaffolded reading materials that gradually increase in
difficulty can foster gradual skill development and build confidence. Additionally,
incorporating various reading strategies, such as chunking, using graphic
organizers, and summarizing, can enhance comprehension and decoding skills.

The use of assistive technologies, such as text-to-speech software or specialized
reading apps, can also make reading more accessible for struggling adolescent
readers. These tools can provide audio support, enabling students to listen to
texts while following along, improving their overall reading experience.
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2. Collaborative Learning

Collaborative learning environments can greatly benefit struggling adolescent
readers. Pairing them with peers who have stronger reading skills can create a
supportive atmosphere where they can learn from each other. This strategy not
only enhances their reading abilities, but it also promotes teamwork,
communication, and friendship.

In group settings, incorporating engaging and interactive activities, such as book
clubs or literature circles, can foster a love for reading. By discussing books,
sharing opinions, and analyzing texts together, struggling adolescent readers can
improve their comprehension and critical thinking skills.

3. Building Vocabulary

A strong vocabulary is crucial for reading comprehension. Struggling adolescent
readers often face difficulties with unfamiliar words, which can hinder their overall
comprehension of texts. Therefore, educators should focus on explicitly teaching
vocabulary, using strategies like word webs, word maps, and context clues.

Incorporating vocabulary-building activities, such as word games, vocabulary
quizzes, and word-of-the-day exercises, can make the learning process more
enjoyable and engaging. By constantly exposing struggling readers to new words
and encouraging their active participation in expanding their vocabulary,
educators can empower them to become more confident readers.

4. Providing Multimodal Texts

For struggling adolescent readers, traditional text-only materials may present
additional challenges. Incorporating multimodal texts, which combine visuals,
audio, and interactive elements, can enhance their reading experience and
improve comprehension.



By utilizing multimedia resources, such as e-books, online articles with audio
narrations, or interactive websites, educators can cater to diverse learning styles
and engage struggling readers more effectively. This approach not only supports
their reading development but also prepares them for the digital world they live in.
5. Cultivating a Reading Culture

To support struggling adolescent readers, it is essential to create a positive
reading culture within the school environment. Encouraging reading for pleasure
through activities like book fairs, author visits, and reading challenges can
motivate students to explore books beyond the classroom.

Additionally, providing a well-stocked and diverse library with age-appropriate
books can expose struggling readers to various genres and topics of interest,
sparking their curiosity and enthusiasm for reading. Regularly celebrating reading
achievements and recognizing students' progress can also boost their confidence
and self-esteem.

Supporting struggling adolescent readers in grade 12 requires a multifaceted
approach that considers their individual needs, collaborative learning, vocabulary
building, multimodal texts, and the creation of a positive reading culture. By
implementing these strategies, educators can empower struggling readers to
overcome their difficulties and develop a lifelong love for reading.
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When students are in elementary school, a teacher who has expertise in teaching
the fundamentals of reading instructs them. At the middle and high school level
that stops – and the timing could not be worse. The literacy demands increase
exponentially, yet typically schools do not teach adolescents how to successfully
read the increasingly difficult materials they encounter throughout their day. As
the rigor increases in their classes, student coping skills become less effective.
Consequently, the achievement gap becomes wider and more difficult to close
during the adolescent years.

When it comes time to prescribe an intervention, middle and high school teachers
are hitting a wall. Decoding and comprehension materials are often presented at
an elementary level. The students feel bad enough that they struggle with
reading; assigned ‘baby work’ increases the stigma. This book addresses the
need for 6-12 teachers to have appropriate literacy intervention materials to use
with struggling adolescent readers.

This book will also help teachers learn how to support any adolescent reader—
struggling or not—when they encounter challenging text. The book features two
strands: decoding and comprehension. Each strand contains lessons, materials,
a difficulty dial, tips for implementation and student samples.
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